BID TAB FOR: Bridge Painting 2007

BID DATE: November 7, 2007

FILE NO.

2007-063-00

CODE: 40310.VF0712

REF. ITEM ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 1. Apollon Painting Company  *2. A-1 Industrial Maint. **3. Spartan Contractiang
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
Arlington Street Bridge - South
1 103.05  Contract Performance Bond 1L.S. $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
2 614 Maintaining Traffic 1L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
3 624 Mobilization 1LS $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
Premium on Railroad’s Protective Public Liability
4 SPEC Insurance 1L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00
5 SPEC Cooperation with Railroads 1 ALLOW $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
6 ODOT 514 Surface Prep. Of Existing Steel, OZEU 13900 S.F. $7.10 $98,690.00 $6.45 $89,655.00 $8.00 $111,200.00 $7.35 $102,165.00
7 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Prime Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $2.75 $38,225.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $2.50 $34,750.00
8 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Interm. Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $3.20 $44,480.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $2.50 $34,750.00
9 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Finish Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $3.20 $44,480.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $2.50 $34,750.00
Grinding Fins, Tears, Slivers on Existing Structural
10 ODOT 514 Steel 18 M.H. $100.00 $1,800.00 $125.00 $2,250.00 $60.00 $1,080.00 $100.00 $1,800.00
11 ODOT 514 Final Inspection Repair 7 Each $450.00 $3,150.00 $350.00 $2,450.00 $150.00 $1,050.00 $300.00 $2,100.00
TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $266,825.00 $208,255.00 $235,730.00 $244,315.00
+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE -22.0% -11.7% -8.4%

* No Bid Bond amount listed

** Ref. #2 change initinaled but not dated

*** Ref. #7 change neither initialed nor dated
**** No Bid Bond amount listed



BID TAB FOR: Bridge Painting 2007

BID DATE: November 7, 2007

FILE NO.

2007-063-00

CODE: 40310.VF0712

REF. ITEM ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 4. Cosmos Comprehensive ***5. Apostolos Group 6. APBN Inc.
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
Arlington Street Bridge - South
1 103.05  Contract Performance Bond 1L.S. $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,105.80 $4,105.80 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
2 614 Maintaining Traffic 1L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,235.00 $8,235.00 $2,917.00 $2,917.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
3 624 Mobilization 1LS $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Premium on Railroad’s Protective Public Liability
4 SPEC Insurance 1L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,235.00 $5,235.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
5 SPEC Cooperation with Railroads 1 ALLOW $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
6 ODOT 514 Surface Prep. Of Existing Steel, OZEU 13900 S.F. $7.10 $98,690.00 $7.10 $98,690.00 $10.00 $139,000.00 $8.00 $111,200.00
7 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Prime Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $2.75 $38,225.00 $2.45 $34,055.00 $3.00 $41,700.00 $3.50 $48,650.00
8 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Interm. Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $3.20 $44,480.00 $2.45 $34,055.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $3.50 $48,650.00
9 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Finish Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $3.20 $44,480.00 $2.45 $34,055.00 $2.00 $27,800.00 $3.50 $48,650.00
Grinding Fins, Tears, Slivers on Existing Structural
10 ODOT 514 Steel 18 M.H. $100.00 $1,800.00 $175.00 $3,150.00 $70.00 $1,260.00 $40.00 $720.00
11 ODOT 514 Final Inspection Repair 7 Each $450.00 $3,150.00 $375.00 $2,625.00 $550.00 $3,850.00 $500.00 $3,500.00
TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $266,825.00 $247,205.80 $277,327.00 $314,370.00
+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE -71.4% +3.9% +17.8%

* No Bid Bond amount listed

** Ref. #2 change initinaled but not dated

*** Ref. #7 change neither initialed nor dated
**** No Bid Bond amount listed



BID TAB FOR: Bridge Painting 2007

BID DATE: November 7, 2007

FILE NO. 2007-063-00

CODE: 40310.VF0712

REF. ITEM ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE ****7. M&J Construction 8. ABHE & Svoboda
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
Arlington Street Bridge - South
1 103.05  Contract Performance Bond 1L.S. $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $9,125.00 $9,125.00 $3,775.00 $3,775.00
2 614 Maintaining Traffic 1L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,650.00 $16,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
3 624 Mobilization 1L.S. $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $34,660.00 $34,660.00
Premium on Railroad’s Protective Public Liability
4 SPEC Insurance 1L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
5 SPEC Cooperation with Railroads 1 ALLOW $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
6 ODOT 514 Surface Prep. Of Existing Steel, OZEU 13900 S.F. $7.10 $98,690.00 $11.00 $152,900.00 $15.50 $215,450.00
7 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Prime Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $2.75 $38,225.00 $3.00 $41,700.00 $2.75 $38,225.00
8 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Interm. Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $3.20 $44,480.00 $3.00 $41,700.00 $1.75 $24,325.00
9 ODOT 514 Field Painting Existing Steel, Finish Coat, OZEU 13900 S.F. $3.20 $44,480.00 $3.00 $41,700.00 $2.25 $31,275.00
Grinding Fins, Tears, Slivers on Existing Structural
10 ODOT 514 Steel 18 M.H. $100.00 $1,800.00 $80.00 $1,440.00 $100.00 $1,800.00
11 ODOT 514 Final Inspection Repair 7 Each $450.00 $3,150.00 $200.00 $1,400.00 $300.00 $2,100.00
TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $266,825.00 $376,865.00 $381,610.00
+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE +41.2% +43.0%

* No Bid Bond amount listed

** Ref. #2 change initinaled but not dated

*** Ref. #7 change neither initialed nor dated
**** No Bid Bond amount listed



