
BID TAB FOR:  Killian Rd. Conlin Water JEDD FILE NO.   2006-014-00  

BID DATE: October 11, 2006 CODE: 24400-P01090

REF. ITEM    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 1. Liberta cba Cioffi 2. Wingfoot Rental & Dev. *3. Central-Allies Enterprises
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1 103.05 Contract Performance Bond 1 L.S. $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00
2 252 Trenches for Water Services in Earth 216 L.F. $10.00 $2,160.00 $6.50 $1,404.00 $17.00 $3,672.00 $35.00 $7,560.00
3 253 Boring for Water Services 1512 L.F. $15.00 $22,680.00 $15.50 $23,436.00 $17.00 $25,704.00 $26.00 $39,312.00
4 254 6 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 400 L.F. $50.00 $20,000.00 $55.00 $22,000.00 $50.00 $20,000.00 $62.00 $24,800.00
5 254 8 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 825 L.F. $55.00 $45,375.00 $60.00 $49,500.00 $57.00 $47,025.00 $58.00 $47,850.00
6 254 12 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 4850 L.F. $70.00 $339,500.00 $82.00 $397,700.00 $84.00 $407,400.00 $61.00 $295,850.00
7 258 6 inch Gate Valve 21 EACH $500.00 $10,500.00 $500.00 $10,500.00 $511.00 $10,731.00 $650.00 $13,650.00
8 258 8 inch Gate Valve 14 EACH $600.00 $8,400.00 $720.00 $10,080.00 $711.00 $9,954.00 $935.00 $13,090.00
9 258 12 inch Gate Valve 12 EACH $1,200.00 $14,400.00 $1,150.00 $13,800.00 $1,220.00 $14,640.00 $1,680.00 $20,160.00

10 259 Special Casting, 6" 45d Bend 2 EACH $200.00 $400.00 $100.00 $200.00 $135.00 $270.00 $75.00 $150.00
11 259 Special Casting, 6" 90d Bend 15 EACH $200.00 $3,000.00 $108.00 $1,620.00 $140.00 $2,100.00 $82.00 $1,230.00
12 259 Special Casting, 8" 45d Bend 7 EACH $250.00 $1,750.00 $146.00 $1,022.00 $180.00 $1,260.00 $107.00 $749.00
13 259 Special Casting, 12" 45d Bend 20 EACH $300.00 $6,000.00 $274.00 $5,480.00 $312.00 $6,240.00 $195.00 $3,900.00
14 259 Special Casting, 12" x 12" Tee 1 EACH $650.00 $650.00 $452.00 $452.00 $480.00 $480.00 $325.00 $325.00
15 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Tee 11 EACH $500.00 $5,500.00 $340.00 $3,740.00 $415.00 $4,565.00 $275.00 $3,025.00
16 259 Special Casting, 12" x 6" Tee 7 EACH $450.00 $3,150.00 $335.00 $2,345.00 $391.00 $2,737.00 $250.00 $1,750.00
17 259 Special Casting, 8" x 6" Tee 12 EACH $350.00 $4,200.00 $205.00 $2,460.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $150.00 $1,800.00
18 259 Special Casting, 6" x 6" Tee 2 EACH $300.00 $600.00 $185.00 $370.00 $205.00 $410.00 $115.00 $230.00
19 259 Special Casting, 6" Plug 2 EACH $90.00 $180.00 $60.00 $120.00 $116.00 $232.00 $41.00 $82.00
20 259 Special Casting, 8" Plug 15 EACH $100.00 $1,500.00 $70.00 $1,050.00 $170.00 $2,550.00 $80.00 $1,200.00
21 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Cross 2 EACH $700.00 $1,400.00 $450.00 $900.00 $525.00 $1,050.00 $335.00 $670.00
22 260 Fire Hydrants 19 EACH $1,500.00 $28,500.00 $1,600.00 $30,400.00 $1,575.00 $29,925.00 $2,850.00 $54,150.00
23 262 1 inch Manual Air Release - Tap Required 1 EACH $300.00 $300.00 $375.00 $375.00 $490.00 $490.00 $645.00 $645.00
24 266 Tapping Water Mains and Installing Services 1728 L.F. $15.00 $25,920.00 $10.00 $17,280.00 $10.00 $17,280.00 $11.00 $19,008.00
25 613 Uniformed Law Enforcement Officer with Patrol Car 300 HR. $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00
26 614 Maintaining Traffic 1 L.S. $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
27 619 Field Office 1 L.S. $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $100.00 $100.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
28 623 Construction Layout Stakes 1 L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $100.00 $100.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
29 624 Mobilization 1 L.S. $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $100.00 $100.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
30 SPEC County Inspection 300 HR. $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $598,265.00 $626,834.00 $643,215.00 $653,886.00

+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE +4.8% +7.5% +9.3%
* No Addendum Acknowledgement
** No Bid Bond
Note: Spano Brothers, Inc. submitted a bid of $535,870, which they subsequently withdrew due to a clerical error, pursuant to state law.
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BID TAB FOR:  Killian Rd. Conlin Water JEDD FILE NO.   2006-014-00  

BID DATE: October 11, 2006 CODE: 24400-P01090

REF. ITEM    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 4. Kenmore Construction 5. Cementech Inc. **6. Karvo Paving
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1 103.05 Contract Performance Bond 1 L.S. $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
2 252 Trenches for Water Services in Earth 216 L.F. $10.00 $2,160.00 $14.00 $3,024.00 $15.00 $3,240.00 $87.50 $18,900.00
3 253 Boring for Water Services 1512 L.F. $15.00 $22,680.00 $22.00 $33,264.00 $14.00 $21,168.00 $6.90 $10,432.80
4 254 6 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 400 L.F. $50.00 $20,000.00 $60.00 $24,000.00 $48.00 $19,200.00 $59.75 $23,900.00
5 254 8 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 825 L.F. $55.00 $45,375.00 $72.00 $59,400.00 $57.00 $47,025.00 $113.00 $93,225.00
6 254 12 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 4850 L.F. $70.00 $339,500.00 $76.00 $368,600.00 $89.00 $431,650.00 $92.50 $448,625.00
7 258 6 inch Gate Valve 21 EACH $500.00 $10,500.00 $600.00 $12,600.00 $505.00 $10,605.00 $515.00 $10,815.00
8 258 8 inch Gate Valve 14 EACH $600.00 $8,400.00 $800.00 $11,200.00 $700.00 $9,800.00 $735.00 $10,290.00
9 258 12 inch Gate Valve 12 EACH $1,200.00 $14,400.00 $1,450.00 $17,400.00 $1,283.00 $15,396.00 $1,400.00 $16,800.00

10 259 Special Casting, 6" 45d Bend 2 EACH $200.00 $400.00 $100.00 $200.00 $137.00 $274.00 $98.00 $196.00
11 259 Special Casting, 6" 90d Bend 15 EACH $200.00 $3,000.00 $100.00 $1,500.00 $142.00 $2,130.00 $104.00 $1,560.00
12 259 Special Casting, 8" 45d Bend 7 EACH $250.00 $1,750.00 $100.00 $700.00 $261.00 $1,827.00 $128.00 $896.00
13 259 Special Casting, 12" 45d Bend 20 EACH $300.00 $6,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $560.00 $11,200.00 $363.00 $7,260.00
14 259 Special Casting, 12" x 12" Tee 1 EACH $650.00 $650.00 $400.00 $400.00 $542.20 $542.20 $397.00 $397.00
15 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Tee 11 EACH $500.00 $5,500.00 $350.00 $3,850.00 $518.00 $5,698.00 $363.00 $3,993.00
16 259 Special Casting, 12" x 6" Tee 7 EACH $450.00 $3,150.00 $300.00 $2,100.00 $409.00 $2,863.00 $340.00 $2,380.00
17 259 Special Casting, 8" x 6" Tee 12 EACH $350.00 $4,200.00 $175.00 $2,100.00 $265.00 $3,180.00 $211.00 $2,532.00
18 259 Special Casting, 6" x 6" Tee 2 EACH $300.00 $600.00 $150.00 $300.00 $215.00 $430.00 $160.00 $320.00
19 259 Special Casting, 6" Plug 2 EACH $90.00 $180.00 $100.00 $200.00 $50.00 $100.00 $25.00 $50.00
20 259 Special Casting, 8" Plug 15 EACH $100.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $1,500.00 $60.00 $900.00 $36.00 $540.00
21 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Cross 2 EACH $700.00 $1,400.00 $450.00 $900.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $454.00 $908.00
22 260 Fire Hydrants 19 EACH $1,500.00 $28,500.00 $1,800.00 $34,200.00 $2,000.00 $38,000.00 $2,150.00 $40,850.00
23 262 1 inch Manual Air Release - Tap Required 1 EACH $300.00 $300.00 $400.00 $400.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $538.00 $538.00
24 266 Tapping Water Mains and Installing Services 1728 L.F. $15.00 $25,920.00 $23.00 $39,744.00 $18.00 $31,104.00 $20.00 $34,560.00
25 613 Uniformed Law Enforcement Officer with Patrol Car 300 HR. $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00
26 614 Maintaining Traffic 1 L.S. $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
27 619 Field Office 1 L.S. $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
28 623 Construction Layout Stakes 1 L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
29 624 Mobilization 1 L.S. $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
30 SPEC County Inspection 300 HR. $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $598,265.00 $656,782.00 $719,632.20 $775,167.80

+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE +9.8% +20.3% +29.6%
* No Addendum Acknowledgement
** No Bid Bond
Note: Spano Brothers, Inc. submitted a bid of $535,870, which they subsequently withdrew due to a clerical error, pursuant to state law.
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BID TAB FOR:  Killian Rd. Conlin Water JEDD FILE NO.   2006-014-00  

BID DATE: October 11, 2006 CODE: 24400-P01090

REF. ITEM    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 7. Vito Gironda Const. 8. Durite Construction 9. Lockhart Concrete
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1 103.05 Contract Performance Bond 1 L.S. $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $12,311.00 $12,311.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
2 252 Trenches for Water Services in Earth 216 L.F. $10.00 $2,160.00 $10.00 $2,160.00 $37.00 $7,992.00 $5.00 $1,080.00
3 253 Boring for Water Services 1512 L.F. $15.00 $22,680.00 $15.00 $22,680.00 $21.00 $31,752.00 $5.00 $7,560.00
4 254 6 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 400 L.F. $50.00 $20,000.00 $55.00 $22,000.00 $57.50 $23,000.00 $65.20 $26,080.00
5 254 8 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 825 L.F. $55.00 $45,375.00 $70.00 $57,750.00 $62.00 $51,150.00 $74.75 $61,668.75
6 254 12 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 4850 L.F. $70.00 $339,500.00 $75.00 $363,750.00 $94.18 $456,773.00 $105.90 $513,615.00
7 258 6 inch Gate Valve 21 EACH $500.00 $10,500.00 $900.00 $18,900.00 $643.00 $13,503.00 $710.00 $14,910.00
8 258 8 inch Gate Valve 14 EACH $600.00 $8,400.00 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $989.00 $13,846.00 $970.00 $13,580.00
9 258 12 inch Gate Valve 12 EACH $1,200.00 $14,400.00 $1,800.00 $21,600.00 $1,774.00 $21,288.00 $1,675.00 $20,100.00

10 259 Special Casting, 6" 45d Bend 2 EACH $200.00 $400.00 $250.00 $500.00 $197.00 $394.00 $190.00 $380.00
11 259 Special Casting, 6" 90d Bend 15 EACH $200.00 $3,000.00 $250.00 $3,750.00 $207.00 $3,105.00 $198.00 $2,970.00
12 259 Special Casting, 8" 45d Bend 7 EACH $250.00 $1,750.00 $250.00 $1,750.00 $676.00 $4,732.00 $265.00 $1,855.00
13 259 Special Casting, 12" 45d Bend 20 EACH $300.00 $6,000.00 $450.00 $9,000.00 $822.00 $16,440.00 $490.00 $9,800.00
14 259 Special Casting, 12" x 12" Tee 1 EACH $650.00 $650.00 $600.00 $600.00 $1,306.00 $1,306.00 $750.00 $750.00
15 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Tee 11 EACH $500.00 $5,500.00 $600.00 $6,600.00 $554.00 $6,094.00 $620.00 $6,820.00
16 259 Special Casting, 12" x 6" Tee 7 EACH $450.00 $3,150.00 $600.00 $4,200.00 $532.00 $3,724.00 $575.00 $4,025.00
17 259 Special Casting, 8" x 6" Tee 12 EACH $350.00 $4,200.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $302.00 $3,624.00 $360.00 $4,320.00
18 259 Special Casting, 6" x 6" Tee 2 EACH $300.00 $600.00 $300.00 $600.00 $252.00 $504.00 $280.00 $560.00
19 259 Special Casting, 6" Plug 2 EACH $90.00 $180.00 $100.00 $200.00 $120.00 $240.00 $50.00 $100.00
20 259 Special Casting, 8" Plug 15 EACH $100.00 $1,500.00 $150.00 $2,250.00 $130.00 $1,950.00 $90.00 $1,350.00
21 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Cross 2 EACH $700.00 $1,400.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $993.00 $1,986.00 $810.00 $1,620.00
22 260 Fire Hydrants 19 EACH $1,500.00 $28,500.00 $3,500.00 $66,500.00 $2,275.00 $43,225.00 $2,300.00 $43,700.00
23 262 1 inch Manual Air Release - Tap Required 1 EACH $300.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $628.00 $628.00 $250.00 $250.00
24 266 Tapping Water Mains and Installing Services 1728 L.F. $15.00 $25,920.00 $10.00 $17,280.00 $10.50 $18,144.00 $10.00 $17,280.00
25 613 Uniformed Law Enforcement Officer with Patrol Car 300 HR. $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00
26 614 Maintaining Traffic 1 L.S. $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $16,100.00 $16,100.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
27 619 Field Office 1 L.S. $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $500.00 $500.00
28 623 Construction Layout Stakes 1 L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,993.00 $3,993.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
29 624 Mobilization 1 L.S. $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $124,000.00 $124,000.00 $25,625.00 $25,625.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
30 SPEC County Inspection 300 HR. $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $598,265.00 $798,970.00 $806,529.00 $816,573.75

+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE +33.5% +34.8% +36.5%
* No Addendum Acknowledgement
** No Bid Bond
Note: Spano Brothers, Inc. submitted a bid of $535,870, which they subsequently withdrew due to a clerical error, pursuant to state law.
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BID TAB FOR:  Killian Rd. Conlin Water JEDD FILE NO.   2006-014-00  

BID DATE: October 11, 2006 CODE: 24400-P01090

REF. ITEM    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE 10. Fechko Excavation
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT

1 103.05 Contract Performance Bond 1 L.S. $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $7,100.00 $7,100.00
2 252 Trenches for Water Services in Earth 216 L.F. $10.00 $2,160.00 $29.73 $6,421.68
3 253 Boring for Water Services 1512 L.F. $15.00 $22,680.00 $20.89 $31,585.68
4 254 6 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 400 L.F. $50.00 $20,000.00 $46.02 $18,408.00
5 254 8 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 825 L.F. $55.00 $45,375.00 $95.57 $78,845.25
6 254 12 inch Ductile Iron Pipe 4850 L.F. $70.00 $339,500.00 $110.12 $534,082.00
7 258 6 inch Gate Valve 21 EACH $500.00 $10,500.00 $617.50 $12,967.50
8 258 8 inch Gate Valve 14 EACH $600.00 $8,400.00 $840.50 $11,767.00
9 258 12 inch Gate Valve 12 EACH $1,200.00 $14,400.00 $1,588.50 $19,062.00

10 259 Special Casting, 6" 45d Bend 2 EACH $200.00 $400.00 $282.37 $564.74
11 259 Special Casting, 6" 90d Bend 15 EACH $200.00 $3,000.00 $200.00 $3,000.00
12 259 Special Casting, 8" 45d Bend 7 EACH $250.00 $1,750.00 $359.93 $2,519.51
13 259 Special Casting, 12" 45d Bend 20 EACH $300.00 $6,000.00 $459.00 $9,180.00
14 259 Special Casting, 12" x 12" Tee 1 EACH $650.00 $650.00 $744.00 $744.00
15 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Tee 11 EACH $500.00 $5,500.00 $660.00 $7,260.00
16 259 Special Casting, 12" x 6" Tee 7 EACH $450.00 $3,150.00 $591.50 $4,140.50
17 259 Special Casting, 8" x 6" Tee 12 EACH $350.00 $4,200.00 $343.44 $4,121.28
18 259 Special Casting, 6" x 6" Tee 2 EACH $300.00 $600.00 $276.95 $553.90
19 259 Special Casting, 6" Plug 2 EACH $90.00 $180.00 $119.25 $238.50
20 259 Special Casting, 8" Plug 15 EACH $100.00 $1,500.00 $147.59 $2,213.85
21 259 Special Casting, 12" x 8" Cross 2 EACH $700.00 $1,400.00 $811.52 $1,623.04
22 260 Fire Hydrants 19 EACH $1,500.00 $28,500.00 $1,621.00 $30,799.00
23 262 1 inch Manual Air Release - Tap Required 1 EACH $300.00 $300.00 $1,045.00 $1,045.00
24 266 Tapping Water Mains and Installing Services 1728 L.F. $15.00 $25,920.00 $13.74 $23,742.72
25 613 Uniformed Law Enforcement Officer with Patrol Car 300 HR. $33.00 $9,900.00 $33.00 $9,900.00
26 614 Maintaining Traffic 1 L.S. $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
27 619 Field Office 1 L.S. $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00
28 623 Construction Layout Stakes 1 L.S. $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,710.00 $2,710.00
29 624 Mobilization 1 L.S. $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
30 SPEC County Inspection 300 HR. $36.00 $10,800.00 $36.00 $10,800.00

TOTAL CONSTRUCTION COSTS $598,265.00 $855,295.15

+/- ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE +43.0%
* No Addendum Acknowledgement
** No Bid Bond
Note: Spano Brothers, Inc. submitted a bid of $535,870, which they subsequently withdrew due to a clerical error, pursuant to state law.
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